February 26, 2025 OSWEGO COUNTY BOCES
02:23:40 pm
Bid Award Detail Report
Bid: SPECIALTY PAPER 2025
SPECIALTY PAPERS BID# B25-0101, 4/1/25 - 3/31/26
By Subcategory/ltem
Unit of
Item ID Description Quantity Unit Price _Measure Total Bid Vendor
Awarded
01-01-004 BRISTOL TAG BOARD - 6 PLY, 24"X36", WHITE, 18.0000 25.7200 PK 462.96  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
100/PKG Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC5226
01-01-006 BRISTOL TAG BOARD, FOLDING WHITE TAG 14.0000 6.1700 PK 86.38  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
BOARD, 12"X18", 100/PKG Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC5214
01-01-007 BRISTOL TAG BOARD - FOLDING TAG BOARD, 5.0000 8.5500 PK 42.75  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
MEDIUM WEIGHT, 12"X18 ", BLACK, 100/PKG Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 111856
01-01-011D CHIPBOARD/NEWSBOARD, 9" X 12", 24/PK 36.0000 45200 PK 162.72  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 112186
01-01-012 FOAMBOARD, CRESCENT® BLACK ON BLACK 4.0000 43.5300 PK Sub. 174.12  Vendor - Blick Art Materials LLC
FOAMBOARD, SMOOTH BLACK PAPER SURFACE Vendor ItemID: 13202-2003
ON BOTH SIDES, BLACK THROUGH TO THE
CORE, 20"X30", 3/16" THICK, NO SUB (Vendor Bid:
FOME-COR FOAMBOARD BLACK; 20"X30"X3/16",
10 pack)
01-01-013 FOAMBOARD, 20"X30" SHEETS, 3/16" THICK 3.0000 19.1100 PK Sub. 57.33  Vendor - School Specialty, LLC
(Vendor Bid: Pacon Acid-Free Foam Board, 20 x 30 Bid Reference: B25-0101
Inches, 3/16 Inch Thickness, White, Pack of 10) Vendor ItemiD: 1398078
01-01-015 MAT BOARD, 20"x30", BLACK 180.0000 4.2900 EA 772.20  Vendor - Blick Art Materials LLC
Vendor ItemID: 13007-2453
01-01-017 MAT BOARD, 20"X32", WHITE 8.0000 4.2900 EA 34.32  Vendor - Blick Art Materials LLC
Vendor ItemID: 13007-1143
01-01-022 FLAWBOARD, CRESCENT® FLAWED MAT BOARD, 1.0000 34.3300 PK 34.33  Vendor - School Specialty, LLC
RANDOM ASSORTMENT OF COLORS & Bid Reference: B25-0101
SURFACES, 11"X14", 100/PKG Vendor ItemID: 408333
01-01-031 POSTER BOARD - WHITE, 12"X18", 100/PKG 4.0000 5.3600 PK 21.44  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC5284
01-01-033 POSTER BOARD - ASSORTED 12"X18", 100/PKG 3.0000 8.7900 PK 26.37  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies

WinCap  Ver. 25.02.13.2477

Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 111863
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02:23:40 pm
Bid Award Detail Report
Bid: SPECIALTY PAPER 2025
SPECIALTY PAPERS BID# B25-0101, 4/1/25 - 3/31/26
By Subcategory/ltem
Unit of
Item ID Description Quantity Unit Price _Measure Total Bid Vendor
01-01-035 RAILROAD (POSTER) BOARD - 6 PLY .024", ASST., 1.0000 11.2200 PK 11.22  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
22"X28", COLORED ON BOTH SIDES, 25/PKG Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 112157
01-01-037 RAILROAD BOARD - 6 PLY, WHITE, 22"X28", 8.0000 3.6000 PK Sub. 28.80  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
25/PKG (Vendor Bid: Railroad board, 6-ply, white, Bid Reference: B25-0101
22x28, 10/pkg) Vendor ItemID: 112145
01-01-051 SHOWCARD/ILLUSTRATION BOARD - 14-PLY 1.0000 43.1000 PK 43.10  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
ILLUSTRATION BOARD, .050" THICK, COLD PRESS Bid Reference: B25-0101
SURFACE, SIZE 20"X30", 10/PKG Vendor ItemID: 112090
01-01-055 TAGBOARD (STANDARD) - 18"X24", ASSORTED, 5.0000 17.5600 PK 87.80  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
100/PKG Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 111925
01-01-065 TAGBOARD (BRIGHT HUE) - 12"X18", ASSORTED, 12.0000 8.7900 PK Sub. 105.48  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
100/PKG (Vendor Bid: Tagboard, 12x18, assorted, Bid Reference: B25-0101
100/pkg) Vendor ItemID: 111863
01-01-069 TAGBOARD (BRIGHT HUE) - 18"X24", WHITE, 9.0000 13.1600 PK 118.44  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
100/PKG Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 111774
01-01-070 TAGBOARD (MANILLA - MEDIUM WT.) -125#, 4.0000 3.1600 PK 12.64 Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
9"X12", 100/PKG Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC5111
01-01-070C TAGBOARD (WHITE - MEDIUM WT.) -125#, 9"X12", 11.0000 3.1600 PK 34.76  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
100/PKG Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC5211
01-01-070D TAGBOARD (WHITE - MEDIUM WT.) -125#, 12"X18" 32.0000 5.3600 PK 171.52  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
, 100/PKG Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC5284
01-01-075 TAGBOARD (MANILLA - HEAVY WT.) - 150#, 6.0000 13.8500 PK 83.10  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
18"X24" , 100/PKG Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC5120
01-08-004 CANVAS PANELS, ECO. PRE-STRETCHED 261.0000 1.1000 EA 287.10  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
CANVAS 8"X10" Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 023715
01-08-004H CANVAS PANELS - CLASSROOM PACK, 11"X14", 246.0000 27.5600 PK 6779.76  Vendor - Blick Art Materials LLC

24/PKG

WinCap  Ver. 25.02.13.2477

Vendor ItemID: 07015-1005
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Description

OSWEGO COUNTY BOCES
Bid Award Detail Report
Bid: SPECIALTY PAPER 2025
SPECIALTY PAPERS BID# B25-0101, 4/1/25 - 3/31/26

Total Bid

Vendor

01-08-005

01-09-009

01-10-002

01-13-005

01-13-035

01-15-000

01-15-000A

01-15-001A

01-15-003

01-15-003A

01-15-004

01-15-004A

PREMIUM GRADE CANVAS BY THE ROLL, 63" W,
PRIMED, BLICK # 07309-1363, 3 YD. ROLL, NO SUB

CELLOPHANE ROLLS, 20"X150", CLEAR

STRATHMORE CHARCOAL PAPER, 19"X25", ASST.
COLORS, 24/PKG

POST CARDS - AVERY # 5389, 4" X 6" POST
CARDS ON 8-1/2" X 11" SHEETS, 100/BX, NO SUB

EPSON PREMIUM LUSTER PHOTO INKJET PAPER
24"X100'/ROLL, MFG# S042081, NO SUB

TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12", 76#,
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, HOLIDAY RED,
50/PKG, NO SUB

HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12",
HOLIDAY RED, 100/PKG (56# - 72#)

HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12",
RED, 100/PKG (56# - 724#)

TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12", 76#,
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, YELLOW, 50/PKG, NO
SuB

HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12",
YELLOW, 100/PKG (56# - 72#)

TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12" 76#,
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, ORANGE, 50/PKG,
NO SUB

HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12",
ORANGE, 100/PKG (56# - 72#)

WinCap  Ver. 25.02.13.2477

By Subcategory/ltem
Unit of
Quantity Unit Price Measure
3.0000 45.4900 RL
1.0000 3.7400 EA
4.0000 34.0400 PK
3.0000 13.9600 BX
2.0000 259.4000 RL
12.0000 1.6600 PK
24.0000 1.8400 PK
9.0000 1.8600 PK
66.0000 1.6200 PK
9.0000 1.4200 PK
55.0000 1.6600 PK
12.0000 1.6900 PK

136.47

136.16

41.88

518.80

19.92

44.16

16.74

106.92

12.78

91.30

20.28

Vendor - Blick Art Materials LLC

Vendor ItemID: 07309-1363

Vendor - Cascade School Supplies

Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 115286

Vendor - Blick Art Materials LLC

Vendor ItemID: 10703-1021

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: AVE5389

Vendor - Metco Supply, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: S450423

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC102993

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC9904

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC6104

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC103004

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC8404

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC103002

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC6604
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01-15-005

01-15-005A

01-15-005B

01-15-005C

01-15-008

01-15-008A

01-15-009

01-15-009A

01-15-010

01-15-010C

01-15-011

TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12", 76#,
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, FESTIVE/EMERALD
GREEN, 50/PKG, NO SUB

HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12",
FESTIVE/EMERALD GREEN, 100/PKG (56# - 72#)
(Vendor Bid: Prang Medium Weight Construction
Paper, 9 x 12 Inches, Holiday Green, Pack of 100)
TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12", 76#,
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, HOLIDAY GREEN,
50/PKG, NO SUB

HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12",
HOLIDAY GREEN, 100/PKG (56# - 72#)

TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12", 76#,
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, BLUE, 50/PKG, NO
SuUB

HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12",
BLUE, 100/PKG (56# - 72#)

TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12", 76#,
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, SKY BLUE, 50/PKG,
NO SuUB

HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12",
SKY BLUE, 100/PKG (56# - 72#)

TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12", 76#,
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, ROYAL BLUE,
50/PKG, NO SUB

HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12",
BRIGHT BLUE, 100/PKG (56# - 72#) (Vendor Bid:
Prang Medium Weight Construction Paper, 9 x 12
Inches, Bright Blue, 100 Sheets)

TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12", 76#,
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, WARM BROWN,
50/PKG, NO SUB

WinCap  Ver. 25.02.13.2477

By Subcategory/ltem
Unit of

Quantity Unit PriceMeasure
53.0000 1.8600 PK

5.0000 1.6300 PK Sub.
56.0000 1.7700 PK
22.0000 1.3800 PK
59.0000 1.7300 PK

5.0000 1.3800 PK
58.0000 1.5500 PK

3.0000 1.3800 PK
51.0000 1.7300 PK

4.0000 1.6300 PK Sub.
39.0000 1.5400 PK

98.58

8.15

99.12

30.36

102.07

6.90

89.90

4.14

88.23

6.52

60.06

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC103006

Vendor - School Specialty, LLC
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 1506504

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC102960

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC8004

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC103022

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC7404

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC103016

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC7604

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC103017

Vendor - School Specialty, LLC
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 1506500

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC103025
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01-15-011A

01-15-012

01-15-012A

01-15-014

01-15-014A

01-15-016

01-15-016A

01-15-017

01-15-017A

01-15-018

01-15-018A

HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12",
WARM BROWN, 100/PKG (56# - 72#) (Vendor Bid:
Prang Medium Weight Construction Paper, 9 x 12
Inches, Light Brown, 100 Sheets)

TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12", 76#,
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, DARK BROWN,
50/PKG, NO SUB

HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12",
DARK BROWN, 100/PKG (56# - 72#)

TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12", 76#,
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, VIOLET, 50/PKG, NO
SuB

HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12",
VIOLET, 100/PKG (56# - 72#)

TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12", 76#,
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, PINK, 50/PKG, NO
SuB

HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12",
PINK, 100/PKG (56# - 72#)

TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12", 76#,
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, SLATE GRAY,
50/PKG, NO SUB

HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12",
SLATE GRAY, 100/PKG (56# - 72#) (Vendor Bid:
Prang Medium Weight Construction Paper, 9 x 12
Inches, Gray, 100 Sheets)

TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12", 76#,
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, WHITE, 50/PKG, NO
SuB

HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12",
WHITE, 100/PKG (56# - 72#)

WinCap  Ver. 25.02.13.2477

By Subcategory/ltem
Unit of
Quantity Unit PriceMeasure
6.0000 1.8600 PK Sub.
38.0000 1.6300 PK
4.0000 1.6900 PK
28.0000 1.6300 PK
6.0000 1.3800 PK
32.0000 1.6900 PK
9.0000 1.3800 PK
40.0000 1.6200 PK
2.0000 1.6300 PK Sub.
77.0000 1.4200 PK
24.0000 1.5300 PK

11.16

61.94

6.76

45.64

8.28

54.08

12.42

64.80

109.34

36.72

Vendor - School Specialty, LLC
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 1506494

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC103024

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC6804

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC103009

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC7204

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC103012

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC7004

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC103028

Vendor - School Specialty, LLC
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 1506509

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC103026

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC9204
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Bid: SPECIALTY PAPER 2025
SPECIALTY PAPERS BID# B25-0101, 4/1/25 - 3/31/26
By Subcategory/ltem
Unit of
Item ID Description Quantity Unit Price Measure Total Bid Vendor
01-15-019 TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12", 76#, 90.0000 1.4400 PK 129.60  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, BLACK, 50/PKG, NO Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC103029
SuB
01-15-019A HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12", 19.0000 1.5000 PK 28.50  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
BLACK, 100/PKG (56# - 72#) Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC6304
01-15-020 TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12", 76#, 7.0000 1.8000 PK 12.60  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, MAGENTA, 50/PKG, Bid Reference: B25-0101
NO SUB Vendor ItemID: PAC103000
01-15-021 TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12", 76#, 12.0000 1.8300 PK 21.96  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, ASSORTED, 50/PKG, Bid Reference: B25-0101
NO SUB Vendor ItemID: PAC103031
01-15-021A HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12", 13.0000 1.8100 PK 23.53  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
ASSORTED, 100/PKG (56# - 72#) Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC6504
01-15-021B CRAYOLA CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12", 6.0000 46700 PK 28.02  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
ASSORTED COLORS, 240/PKG, NO SUB Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 039195
01-15-022 TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12", 76#, 13.0000 1.7700 PK 23.01  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, TURQUOISE, Bid Reference: B25-0101
50/PKG, NO SUB Vendor ItemID: PAC103007
01-15-022A HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12", 4.0000 1.6300 PK Sub. 6.52  Vendor - School Specialty, LLC
TURQUOISE, 100/PKG (56# - 72#) (Vendor Bid: Bid Reference: B25-0101
Prang Medium Weight Construction Paper, 9 x 12 Vendor ItemlID: 1506502
Inches, Turquoise, 100 Sheets)
01-15-023 TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12", 76#, 19.0000 1.7900 PK 34.01  Vendor - School Specialty, LLC
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, PEACH/SALMON, Bid Reference: B25-0101
50/PKG, NO SUB Vendor ItemID: 053991
01-16-000 TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 76#, 86.0000 3.1500 PK 270.90  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, HOLIDAY RED, Bid Reference: B25-0101
50/PKG, NO SUB Vendor ItemID: PAC102994
01-16-000A HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 2.0000 3.6700 PK 7.34  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
HOLIDAY/FESTIVE RED, 100/PKG (56# - 72#) Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC9908
01-16-001 TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 76#, 69.0000 4.3500 PK 300.15  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies

HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, RED, 50/PKG, NO
SuB

WinCap  Ver. 25.02.13.2477

Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 016524
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Page 7

01-16-001A

01-16-003

01-16-004

01-16-004A

01-16-004B

01-16-005A

01-16-006

01-16-006A

01-16-008

01-16-009

01-16-009A

01-16-010

HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18",
RED, 100/PKG (56# - 72#)

TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 76#,
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, PEACH/SALMON,
50/PKG, NO SUB

TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 76#,
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, PINK, 50/PKG, NO
sSuB

HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18",
PINK, 100/PKG (56# - 72#)

TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 76#,
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, SHOCKING PINK,
50/PKG, NO SUB

TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 76#,
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, LIVELY LEMON,
50/PKG, NO SUB

TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 76#,
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, YELLOW, 50/PKG, NO
SuB

HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18",
YELLOW, 100/PKG (56# - 724#)

TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 76# ,
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, ELECTRIC ORANGE,
50/PKG, NO SUB

TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 76# ,
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, ORANGE, 50/PKG, NO
SuB

HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18",
ORANGE, 100/PKG (56# - 72#)

TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 76#,
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, FESTIVE/EMERALD
GREEN, 50/PKG, NO SUB

WinCap  Ver. 25.02.13.2477

By Subcategory/ltem
Unit of
Quantity Unit PriceMeasure
22.0000 3.6700 PK
39.0000 3.5500 PK
39.0000 3.1800 PK
16.0000 2.6900 PK
39.0000 3.2100 PK
16.0000 4.5800 PK
86.0000 3.1200 PK
23.0000 2.6900 PK
67.0000 4.6400 PK
72.0000 3.1600 PK
19.0000 3.2900 PK
36.0000 3.5400 PK

80.74

138.45

124.02

43.04

125.19

73.28

268.32

61.87

310.88

227.52

62.51

127.44

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC6108

Vendor - School Specialty, LLC
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 054090

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC103044

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC7008

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC103045

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC103403

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC103036

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC8408

Vendor - School Specialty, LLC
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 1537845

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC103034

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC6608

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC103038
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Total Bid

Vendor
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01-16-010A

01-16-010B

01-16-010C

01-16-012B

01-16-013

01-16-013A

01-16-014

01-16-014A

01-16-015

01-16-0165

01-16-017

HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18",
FESTIVE/EMERALD GREEN, 100/PKG (56# - 72#)
(Vendor Bid: Prang Medium Weight Construction
Paper, 12 x 18 Inches, Holiday Green, 100 Sheets)
TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 76#,
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, HOLIDAY GREEN,
50/PKG, NO SUB

HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18",
HOLIDAY GREEN, 100/PKG (56# - 72#)

TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 76#,
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, BRILLIANT LIME,
50/PKG, NO SUB

TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 76#,
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, TURQUOISE, 50/PKG,
NO SUB

HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18",
TURQUOISE, 100/PKG (56# - 72#) (Vendor Bid:
Prang Medium Weight Construction Paper, 12 x 18
Inches, Turquoise, 100 Sheets)

TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 76#,
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, BLUE, 50/PKG, NO
SuB

HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18",
BLUE, 100/PKG (56# - 724#)

TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18" 76#,
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, SKY BLUE, 50/PKG,
NO SuUB

TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 76#,
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, ROYAL BLUE,
50/PKG, NO SUB

TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 76#,
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, VIOLET, 50/PKG, NO
SuB

WinCap  Ver. 25.02.13.2477

By Subcategory/ltem
Unit of

Quantity Unit PriceMeasure
39.0000 3.3000 PK Sub.
60.0000 3.3600 PK

9.0000 2.6900 PK
22.0000 2.8500 PK
20.0000 3.4200 PK
10.0000 3.3000 PK Sub.
33.0000 3.2900 PK
18.0000 2.6900 PK
37.0000 2.9600 PK
29.0000 3.2900 PK
25.0000 3.1200 PK

128.70

201.60

24.21

62.70

68.40

33.00

108.57

48.42

109.52

95.41

78.00

Vendor - School Specialty, LLC
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 1506530

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC102961

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC8008

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC103425

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC103039

Vendor - School Specialty, LLC
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 1506540

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC103054

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC7408

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC103048

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC103049

Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC103041
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Bid Award Detail Report
Bid: SPECIALTY PAPER 2025
SPECIALTY PAPERS BID# B25-0101, 4/1/25 - 3/31/26
By Subcategory/ltem
Unit of
Item ID Description Quantity Unit Price Measure Total Bid Vendor
01-16-017A HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 17.0000 2.6900 PK 45.73  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
VIOLET, 100/PKG (56# - 72#) Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC7208
01-16-019 TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 76#, 11.0000 3.4000 PK 37.40  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, MAGENTA, 50/PKG, Bid Reference: B25-0101
NO SUB Vendor ItemID: PAC103032
01-16-020A HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 15.0000 3.7700 PK Sub. 56.55  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
LIGHT BROWN, 100/PKG (56# - 72#) (Vendor Bid: Bid Reference: B25-0101
Warm Brown, 100/pkg) Vendor ItemID: 116037
01-16-021A HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 5.0000 2.9400 PK 14.70  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
BROWN, 100/PKG (56# - 72#) Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC6708
01-16-022 TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 76#, 20.0000 3.0500 PK 61.00  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, DARK Bid Reference: B25-0101
BROWN,50/PKG, NO SUB Vendor ItemID: PAC103056
01-16-022A HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 11.0000 3.2900 PK 36.19  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
DARK BROWN, 100/PKG (56# - 72#) Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC6808
01-16-023 TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 76#, 23.0000 2.9000 PK 66.70  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, WARM BROWN, Bid Reference: B25-0101
50/PKG, NO SUB Vendor ItemID: PAC103057
01-16-026 TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 76#, 23.0000 3.1200 PK 71.76  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, SLATE GRAY, Bid Reference: B25-0101
50/PKG, NO SUB Vendor ItemID: PAC103060
01-16-026A HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 8.0000 3.3000 PK Sub. 26.40  Vendor - School Specialty, LLC
SLATE GRAY, 100/PKG (56# - 72#) (Vendor Bid: Bid Reference: B25-0101
Prang Medium Weight Construction Paper, 12 x 18 Vendor ItemID: 1506535
Inches, Gray, 100 Sheets)
01-16-027 TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 76#, 74.0000 2.6700 PK 197.58  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, WHITE, 50/PKG, NO Bid Reference: B25-0101
SUB Vendor ItemID: PAC103058
01-16-027A HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 43.0000 3.1400 PK 135.02  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
WHITE, 100/PKG (56# - 72#) Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC8708
01-16-028 TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 76#, 147.0000 2.7600 PK 405.72  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.

HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, BLACK, 50/PKG, NO
SuB

WinCap  Ver. 25.02.13.2477

Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC103061
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OSWEGO COUNTY BOCES

02:23:40 pm
Bid Award Detail Report
Bid: SPECIALTY PAPER 2025
SPECIALTY PAPERS BID# B25-0101, 4/1/25 - 3/31/26
By Subcategory/ltem
Unit of
Item ID Description Quantity Unit Price _Measure Total Bid Vendor
01-16-028A HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 23.0000 2.9400 PK 67.62  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
BLACK, 100/PKG (56# - 72#) Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC6308
01-16-031 TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 76#, 20.0000 3.5800 PK 71.60  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, ASSORTED, 50/PKG, Bid Reference: B25-0101
NO SUB Vendor ItemID: PAC103063
01-16-031A HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 25.0000 3.6400 PK 91.00  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
ASSORTED, 100/PKG (56# - 72#) Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC6508
01-17-008 TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 18"X24", 76#, 5.0000 6.4200 PK 32.10  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, SKY BLUE, 50/PKG, Bid Reference: B25-0101
NO SUB Vendor ItemID: 016080
01-17-012 TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 18"X24", 76#, 2.0000 5.8700 PK 11.74  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, WHITE, 50/PKG, NO Bid Reference: B25-0101
SUB Vendor ItemID: PAC103090
01-17-013 TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 18"X24", 76#, 26.0000 6.1200 PK 159.12  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, BLACK, 50/PKG, NO Bid Reference: B25-0101
SUB Vendor ItemID: PAC103093
01-17-013A HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 18"X24", 6.0000 7.4500 PK 44.70  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
BLACK, 100/PKG (56# - 72#) Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 116261
01-17-016A HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 18"X24", 1.0000 9.0600 PK 9.06  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
ASSORTED, 100/PKG (56# - 72#) Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 116165
01-18-024 HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 24"X36", 16.0000 12.6900 PK Sub. 203.04  Vendor - School Specialty, LLC
ASSORTED, 100/PKG (56# - 72#) (Vendor Bid: Prang Bid Reference: B25-0101
Medium Weight Construction Paper, 24 x 36 Inches, Vendor ItemID: 1506558
Assorted Colors, 50 Sheets)
01-18-025 TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 24"X36", 76#, 27.0000 14.5800 PK 393.66  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, WHITE, 50/PKG, NO Bid Reference: B25-0101
SUB Vendor ItemID: PAC1031225
01-18-027 TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 24"X36", 76#, 4.0000 17.2400 PK 68.96  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, ASSORTED, 50/PKG, Bid Reference: B25-0101
NO SUB Vendor ItemID: PAC1031275
01-22-001 DOILIES - 4", WHITE, ROUND, 100/PKG 4.0000 3.8000 PK 15.20  Vendor - Metco Supply, Inc.

WinCap  Ver. 25.02.13.2477

Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 10004
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Bid Award Detail Report
Bid: SPECIALTY PAPER 2025
SPECIALTY PAPERS BID# B25-0101, 4/1/25 - 3/31/26
By Subcategory/ltem
Unit of
Item ID Description Quantity Unit Price _Measure Total Bid Vendor
01-22-002 DOILIES - 6", WHITE, ROUND, 100/PKG 2.0000 4.9000 PK 9.80  Vendor - Metco Supply, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 10006
01-22-003 DOILIES - 10", WHITE, ROUND, 100/PKG 1.0000 6.2500 PK 6.25  Vendor - Metco Supply, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 10010
01-23-001 DRAWING PAPER - COLONIAL WHITE 70#, 9"X12" 6.0000 9.9300 RM Sub. 59.58  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
(Vendor Bid: Drawing paper, white, 70#, 9x12) Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 110776
01-23-002 DRAWING PAPER - COLONIAL WHITE 70#, 1.0000 19.8400 RM Sub. 19.84  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
12"X18"( Vendor Bid: Drawing Paper, white, Bid Reference: B25-0101
70#,12x18) Vendor ItemID: 110777
01-24-001 DRAWING PAPER - WHITE SULPHITE, 9"X12", 68.0000 20.4400 RM 1389.92  Vendor - Blick Art Materials LLC
80#, DICK BLICK #10209-1033 ONLY, NO SUB Vendor ItemID: 10209-1033
01-24-002 DRAWING PAPER - WHITE SULPHITE, 12"X18", 54.0000 41.3800 RM 2234.52  Vendor - Blick Art Materials LLC
80#, DICK BLICK #10209-1078 ONLY, NO SUB Vendor ItemID: 10209-1078
01-24-002A DRAWING PAPER - WHITE SULPHITE, 12"X18", 6.0000 19.0300 RM 114.18  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
80# Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC4812
01-24-003 DRAWING PAPER - WHITE 18"X24", 80#, DICK 5.0000 82.6600 RM 413.30  Vendor - Blick Art Materials LLC
BLICK #10209-1039 ONLY, NO SUB Vendor ItemID: 10209-1039
01-24-004 DRAWING PAPER - WHITE SULPHITE, 18"X24", 1.0000 46.2200 RM 46.22  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
90# Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC104084
01-24-007 STRATHMORE 400 SERIES DRAWING PAPER 2.0000 46.5000 PK 93.00  Vendor - Blick Art Materials LLC
100#, 19"X24", 50/PK, NO SUB Vendor ItemID: 10206-1119-50
01-25-001 MANILA DRAWING PAPER, 60-64#, 9"X12" 12.0000 6.3200 RM 75.84  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC4209
01-25-002 MANILA DRAWING PAPER, 60-64#, 12"X18" 4.0000 12.2500 RM 49.00 Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC4212
01-29-001 SKETCH BOOKS - BLICK STUDIO DRAWING PAD 44.0000 5.8600 PK 257.84  Vendor - Blick Art Materials LLC

#10314-1053, SPIRAL ON SHORT SIDE, 9"X12",
WHITE, 80#, 70 SHEETS/PD, NO SUB

WinCap  Ver. 25.02.13.2477

Vendor ItemID: 10314-1053
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Bid Award Detail Report
Bid: SPECIALTY PAPER 2025
SPECIALTY PAPERS BID# B25-0101, 4/1/25 - 3/31/26
By Subcategory/ltem
Unit of
Item ID Description Quantity Unit Price _Measure Total Bid Vendor
01-29-006 SKETCH BOOKS - CACHET HARDBOUND SOHO 30.0000 29100 EA 87.30  Vendor - Blick Art Materials LLC
BASIC BLACK COVER SKETCHBOOK, 4"X6", Vendor ItemID: 11808-2003
CONTAINS 60 LB. WHITE DRAWING PAPER, 160
PAGES/80 SHEETS, BLICK #10302-1001/EQUAL
01-29-025 MIXED MEDIA PAD - BLICK STUIDO #13649-1023, 45.0000 5.6300 PD 253.35  Vendor - Blick Art Materials LLC
SPIRAL ON THE SHORT SIDE, 9"X12", WHITE, Vendor ltemID: 13649-1023
80#, 60SHEETS/PAD
01-32-001 FOIL METALLIC PAPER - GOLD 20"X26", 12/PKG 13.0000 10.8800 PK 141.44  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 114866
01-32-002 FOIL METALLIC PAPER - SILVER 20"X26", 12/PKG 13.0000 10.8800 PK 141.44  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 114867
01-32-011 FOIL METALLIC PAPER - ASSORTED, 8"X10", 9.0000 6.7000 PK Sub. 60.30  Vendor - School Specialty, LLC
20/PKG (Vendor Bid: Hygloss Embossed Metallic Bid Reference: B25-0101
Paper, 8-1/2 x 10 Inches, Assorted Colors, 30 Sheets) Vendor ltem|D: 404399
01-35-004 DUO-FINISH KRAFT ECO ROLL, 36"W X 1000'L - 2.0000 47.2000 RL 94.40  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
WHITE Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 115554
01-35-005 DUO-FINISH KRAFT ECO ROLL, 36"W X 1000'L - 4.0000 50.8000 RL 203.20  Vendor - School Specialty, LLC
BLACK Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 027282
01-35-008 DUO-FINISH KRAFT ECO ROLL, 36"W X 1000'L - 1.0000 48.0500 RL Sub. 48.05  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
EMERALD GREEN (Vendor Bid: Holiday Green) Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 115559
01-39-000 PACON® FADELESS DUET ART PAPER, BOTH 1.0000 7.0600 PK 7.06  Vendor - School Specialty, LLC
SIDES ARE A DIFFERENT BUT COORDINATING Bid Reference: B25-0101
COLOR, 12"X18", 30/PKG Vendor ItemID: 006639
01-39-003 CHART TABLET, 1" RULE, 2-HOLE PUNCHED, 5.0000 3.5200 PD 17.60  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
24"X32", 25/PAD Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 166393
01-39-015 EASEL PAD (NO LINES), WHITE 18"X24", 50/PAD 5.0000 25.9000 PD 129.50  Vendor - Metco Supply, Inc.
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 45600 - 27 X 34
01-39-023 FLOURESCENT PAPER, 22"X28", ASST.COLORS, 6.0000 11.5600 PK 69.36  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
12/PKG Bid Reference: B25-0101

WinCap  Ver. 25.02.13.2477

Vendor ItemID: 115449



February 26, 2025 OSWEGO COUNTY BOCES Page 13
02:23:40 pm
Bid Award Detail Report
Bid: SPECIALTY PAPER 2025
SPECIALTY PAPERS BID# B25-0101, 4/1/25 - 3/31/26
By Subcategory/ltem
Unit of
Item ID Description Quantity Unit Price _Measure Total Bid Vendor
01-39-051 ORIGAMI PAPER, 9"X9", 55/PK (Vendor Bid: 8.0000 9.0700 PK 72.56  Vendor - School Specialty, LLC
Yasutomo Fold-Ems Origami Paper, 9-3/4 x 9-3/4 Bid Reference: B25-0101
Inches, Assorted Colors, 100 Sheets) Vendor ItemID: 227619
01-39-053 VELOUR PAPER - ASST.COLORS, 8-1/2"X10" , 3.0000 10.2400 PK 30.72  Vendor - School Specialty, LLC
20/PK Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 317328
01-39-057 WATERCOLOR PAPER - 90#, 12"X16", 100/PK 14.0000 37.6000 PK 526.40  Vendor - Blick Art Materials LLC
Vendor ItemID: 10081-1056
01-39-060 WATERCOLOR PAPER - 90#, 15" X 22", BLICK# 110.0000 0.4000 EA 44.00  Vendor - Blick Art Materials LLC
10028-1028, NO SUB Vendor ItemID: 10028-1028
01-39-061 WATERCOLOR PAPER - WHITE, 22"X30", 140# 34.0000 29.0000 PK 986.00  Vendor - Blick Art Materials LLC
ONLY, 25/PK Vendor ItemID: 10008-1022-25
01-43-006 PRE-CUT MATS, 8"X10", BLACK, 10/PK 38.0000 9.3300 PK 354.54  Vendor - School Specialty, LLC
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 409657
01-43-011 PRE-CUT MATS, 11"X14", BLACK, 10/PK 10.0000 11.4000 PK 114.00  Vendor - School Specialty, LLC
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 408337
01-43-030 PRE-CUT MATS, 16"X20", BLACK, 10/PK 5.0000 23.3800 PK 116.90  Vendor - School Specialty, LLC
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 248460
01-43-040 PRE-CUT MATS, 18"X24", BLACK, 10/PK 11.0000 41.9800 PK 461.78  Vendor - School Specialty, LLC
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 248464
01-53-000 SCRATCH ART BOARD, 8-1/2"X11", HEAVY DUTY 3.0000 7.7100 PK 2313  Vendor—Blick-ArtMaterials LG No Award - Vendor Error.
PRE-INKED, GOLD-FOILWITH BLACK COATING
50/PKG, SCRATCH-BRITE
01-63-001 TISSUE PAPER - ASSORTED COLORS, 20"X30", 10.0000 8.3200 PK 83.20  Vendor - W.B. Mason Co, Inc.
100/PK Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: PAC58516
01-63-002 TISSUE PAPER - WHITE, 20"X30", 24/PK 12.0000 1.1600 PK 13.92  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 115335
01-63-003 TISSUE PAPER - SCARLET, 20"X30", 24/PK 1.0000 1.4000 PK 1.40  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies

WinCap  Ver. 25.02.13.2477

Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 115325


Holly Cheeley
Cross-Out

Holly Cheeley
Cross-Out

Holly Cheeley
Cross-Out
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Bid: SPECIALTY PAPER 2025
SPECIALTY PAPERS BID# B25-0101, 4/1/25 - 3/31/26
By Subcategory/ltem
Unit of
Item ID Description Quantity Unit Price _Measure Total Bid Vendor
01-63-004 TISSUE PAPER - ORANGE, 20"X30", 24/PK 1.0000 1.4000 PK 140  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 115327
01-63-006 TISSUE PAPER - PURPLE, 20"X30", 24/PK 1.0000 14000 PK 1.40  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 115340
01-63-008 TISSUE PAPER - PINK, 20"X30", 24/PK 1.0000 1.4000 PK 1.40  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 115326
01-63-009 TISSUE PAPER - BROWN, 20"X30", 24/PK 1.0000 1.4000 PK 1.40  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 115333
01-63-011 TISSUE PAPER - BLACK, 20"X30", 24/PK 1.0000 1.4000 PK 1.40  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 115334
01-63-014 TISSUE PAPER - MANDARIN RED, 20"X30", 24/PK 1.0000 1.4000 PK Sub. 1.40  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
(Vendor Bid: Red, 24/pk) Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 115345
01-63-015 TISSUE PAPER - YELLOW, 20"X30", 24/PK 1.0000 1.4000 PK 140  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 115328
01-63-016 TISSUE PAPER - APPLE GREEN, 20"X30", 24/PK 1.0000 1.4000 PK 1.40  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 115329
01-63-017 TISSUE PAPER - DARK BLUE, 20"X30", 24/PK 1.0000 1.4000 PK 1.40  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 115336
01-63-018 TISSUE PAPER - HOLLY GREEN (EMERALD), 1.0000 1.4000 PK Sub. 1.40  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
20"X30", 24/PK (Vendor Bid: Dark Green, 24/pk) Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 115331
01-63-019 TISSUE PAPER - LIGHT BLUE, 20"X30", 24/PK 1.0000 1.4000 PK 1.40  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 115330
01-63-020 TISSUE PAPER - TURQUOISE, 20"X30", 24/PK 1.0000 14000 PK 1.40  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies

WinCap  Ver. 25.02.13.2477

Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 125337
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SPECIALTY PAPERS BID# B25-0101, 4/1/25 - 3/31/26
By Subcategory/ltem
Unit of
ltem ID Description Quantity Unit Price _Measure Total Bid _Vendor
01-63-021 TISSUE PAPER - ASSORTED, 12"X18" NON 3.0000 56100 PK 16.83  Vendor - Blick Art Materials LLC
BLEEDING, 50/PKG, BLICK #11308-1006, ONLY, NO Vendor ItemID: 11308-1006
SUB
01-64-001 TRACING PAPER - WHITE PARCHMENT PAPER, 4.0000 1.9400 PD Sub. 7.76  Vendor - Cascade School Supplies
9"X12", 50/PAD (Vendor Bid: 40 shts/pad) Bid Reference: B25-0101
Vendor ItemID: 030783
01-64-003 TRACING PAPER - BLICK STUDIO TRACING 4.0000 5.1200 PD 20.48  Vendor - Blick Art Materials LLC
PAPER PAD, 9"x12", 100/PAD, #10609-3103, NO Vendor ItemID: 10609-3103
SuUB
01-64-011 SARAL WAX FREE TRANSFER PAPER, 12-1/2"X12' 10.0000 9.9200 RL 99.20  Vendor - Blick Art Materials LLC
ROLL, GRAPHITE FOR ALL PURPOSE TRACING, Vendor ltemID: 12917-2612
NO SUB
Totals for - 170 Items $26,618.61

WinCap  Ver. 25.02.13.2477
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Bid Award Detail Report
Bid: SPECIALTY PAPER 2025
SPECIALTY PAPERS BID# B25-0101, 4/1/25 - 3/31/26
By Subcategory/ltem
Unit of
ltem ID Description Quantity Unit Price _Measure Total Bid _Vendor
No Award/All Bids Rejected
01-08-001 CANVAS PANELS - 14"X18", FREDRIX, NO SUB EA
Reason: [013395] Minimum Order Requirement
[013920] Did not bid as specified
01-08-002 CANVAS PANELS - 18"X24", FREDRIX, NO SUB EA
Reason: Did not bid as specified
01-13-030 EPSON ENHANCED MATTE PAPER 24"X100'/ROLL, RL
MFG# S041595, NO SUB
Reason: Above Current Market Price
01-53-002 SCRATCH ART BOARD, CLASSROOM SCRATCH PK
BOARD,11"X14", 12/PKG
Reason: Above Current Market Price
Totals for No Award/All Bids Rejected 4 |tems
No Bid
01-01-011 BRISTOL BOARD, STRATHMORE 400 SERIES PK
22"X30", 3 PLY REG SURFACE, 25/PKG, NO SUB
01-15-001 TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12", 76#, PK
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, RED, 50/PKG, NO
SuB
01-15-002 TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12", 76#, PK

HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, LIGHT YELLOW,
50/PKG, NO SUB

01-15-006 TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12", 76#, PK
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, DARK GREEN,
50/PKG, NO SUB

01-15-007 TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12", 76#, PK
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, LIGHT GREEN,
50/PKG, NO SUB

01-15-015 TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9"X12:, 76# , PK
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, LAVENDERI/LILAC,
50/PKG, NO SUB

01-16-011 TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 76#, PK
HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, DARK GREEN,
50/PKG, NO SUB

01-16-011A HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", PK
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Unit of
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DARK GREEN, 100/PKG (56# - 72#)
01-16-012 TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 76#, PK

HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, CHARTREUSE,

50/PKG, NO SUB
01-16-012A HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", PK

LIGHT GREEN, 100/PKG (56# - 72#)
01-16-018 TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", 76#, PK

HIGH SULPHITE FADELESS, LAVENDERI/LILAC,

50/PKG, NO SUB
01-16-018A HEAVYWEIGHT CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 12"X18", PK

LAVENDER/LILAC, 100/PKG (56# - 72#)
01-53-010 SCRATCH-ART® - SCRATCH-FOAM SOFT PK

SURFACE PRINTING BOARD, 9" x 12", NO NEED

FOR SHARP TOOLS, SCRATCH ART# SC-F,

12/PKG, NO SUB

Totals for No Bid 13 Items

Bid Totals 187 Items $26,618.61

Selection Criteria
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Items not awarded are included
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